# RFQ # TBD

Item	Description	Unit Price	Qty	Ext. Price	
Α	Roof replacement according to specifications.	19,859.94	1	19859.14	
В	Cost per linear foot for any new facia needed		TBD		
С	Cost per square foot for decking replacement	# 7.00	TBD		
D	Add Alt for replacement of gutters and downspouts in like fashion.				
E					
	Applicable state sales tax (8.8%)				
	Total Price>				

	Valentine Roofing Inc	
Company Name:	MILEN THE	-
Signature:	Mark ynch	
Print Name and Title:	Mark Lyuch	
Date:	8-7-23	

5475 Maxwelton Road Langley, WA 98260 360-221-7187

## **Request for Quote - TBD**

This is not an order.

**RFQ # TBD** - July 17th, 2023

**Description:** Shingle Re-roofing of the South Whidbey Baseball Facility(5495 Maxwelton Rd, Langley, WA 98260) site with an area of approximately 2,500 sq.ft. Project to include: Removal of existing roofing and proper disposal. Repair/replace any damaged decking, fascia or trim on a unit cost basis. Apply ice and water shield to entire roof(Garland R-mer Seal SA Underlayment or other pre-approved product). Install composition shingles meeting ASTM D 3161 Class F and ASTM D 7158 Class H wind standards, Class A fire resistance, ASTM D3018 D3462 (CertainTeed Landmark, Malarkey Vista or approved alternate) Install drip-edge flashing at all rake/gable edges. Install ridge vent at horizontal ridges. Install new lead boots at electrical mast. Install all new lead pipe boots. clean gutters and downspouts. Contractor responsible for all permitting. Contract completion date to be mutually determined at award of contract. **Work to be completed by November 30th 2023.** 

Additional Documents: Project Manual

Contact Name: Tom Fallon, Park Superintendent

Phone: 360-221-7181

Fax: 360-221-7323

Email: Parkmaint@whidbey.org

#### Vendor shall complete the area below:

Upon completion, clean all work related debris from site.

The undersigned offers and agrees, if this offer is accepted within 30 calendar days from the date received, to furnish all items or services quoted, at the prices set forth in this quotation, within the time specified herein. In the event of a contract award pursuant to this request, performance by the vendor of any or all of the services, or delivery of any or all of the products defined herein, shall constitute acceptance of all terms, conditions and requirements of the resulting agreement.

Company Name:	Valentine Roof,	ing			
Address: 400 In	dustry Dr.	License #: 60	14-983-5	44 VALENRL	181RW
City: Tuku	vila			Cip: 98/88	dt
Email: Mark. L	ynch@valentinercoF.com	Phone: 206 57.	5 7656 F	ax:	
Print Name and Title:	Mark Lynch	-Sales Es	tima tox		
No Bid [ ] Reason:					

## RFQ # TBD

Item	Description	Unit Price	Qty	Ext. Price	
A	Roof replacement according to specifications.		1	29,95000	
В	Cost per linear foot for any new facia needed			1800	
С	Cost per square foot for decking replacement			1,50	
D	Add Alt for replacement of gutters and downspouts in like fashion.			6,75000	
E					
	Applicable state sales tax (8.8%)			3,229.60 39,979.60	
	Total Price>				

Company Name:	Fred Meyer Roofing
Signature:	- F.W.
Print Name and Title:	Fred Proger - owner
Date:	7-27-23

5475 Maxwelton Road Langley, WA 98260 360-221-7187

## **Request for Quote - TBD**

This is not an order.

**RFQ # TBD** - July 17th, 2023

Description: Shingle Re-roofing of the South Whidbey Baseball Facility(5495 Maxwelton Rd, Langley, WA 98260) site with an area of approximately 2,500 sq.ft. Project to include: Removal of existing roofing and proper disposal. Repair/replace any damaged decking, fascia or trim on a unit cost basis. Apply ice and water shield to entire roof(Garland R-mer Seal SA Underlayment or other pre-approved product). Install composition shingles meeting ASTM D 3161 Class F and ASTM D 7158 Class H wind standards, Class A fire resistance, ASTM D3018 D3462 (CertainTeed Landmark, Malarkey Vista or approved alternate) Install drip-edge flashing at all rake/gable edges. Install ridge vent at horizontal ridges. Install new lead boots at electrical mast. Install all new lead pipe boots. clean gutters and downspouts. Contractor responsible for all permitting. Contract completion date to be mutually determined at award of contract. Work to be completed by November 30th 2023.

Upon completion, clean all work related debris from site.

Additional Documents: Project Manual

Contact Name: Tom Fallon, Park Superintendent

Phone: 360-221-7181

Fax: 360-221-7323

Email: Parkmaint@whidbey.org

Wendor shall complete the area below:

The undersigned offers and agrees, if this offer is accepted within 30 calendar days from the date received, to furnish all items or services quoted, at the prices set forth in this quotation, within the time specified herein. In the event of a contract award pursuant to this request, performance by the vendor of any or all of the services, or delivery of any or all of the products defined herein, shall constitute acceptance of all terms, conditions and

Company Name: Fred Meyer Roofing	0	
Address: 1620 SW 156 th St.	License #:	
City: Burien	State: WA	Zip: 98166
Email: fred meyerrooting 2002@gmail. (om Phon	ne: (206) 478-3733	Fax:
Print Name and Title: Fred Meyer - own	ne C	
No Bid [ ] Reason:		

requirements of the resulting agreement.

# RFQ # TBD

Item	Description	Unit Price	Qty	Ext. Price
A	Roof replacement according to specifications.		1	\$30,000.00
В	Cost per linear foot for any new facia needed	\$30.00		
С	Cost per square foot for decking replacement	\$7.00		
D	Add Alt for replacement of gutters and downspouts in like fashion.			\$7,800.00
E				
	Applicable state sales tax (8.8%)			\$3,326.40
		Total	Price>	\$41,126.40

Company Name:	Olympic Roofing, LLC
Signature:	The free
Print Name and Title:	Jennifer Hudson, Office Manager
Date:	7/28/2023

5475 Maxwelton Road Langley, WA 98260 360-221-7187

## **Request for Quote - TBD**

This is not an order.

**RFQ # TBD** - July 17th, 2023

**Description:** Shingle Re-roofing of the South Whidbey Baseball Facility(5495 Maxwelton Rd, Langley, WA 98260) site with an area of approximately 2,500 sq.ft. Project to include: Removal of existing roofing and proper disposal. Repair/replace any damaged decking, fascia or trim on a unit cost basis. Apply ice and water shield to entire roof(Garland R-mer Seal SA Underlayment or other pre-approved product). Install composition shingles meeting ASTM D 3161 Class F and ASTM D 7158 Class H wind standards, Class A fire resistance, ASTM D3018 D3462 (CertainTeed Landmark, Malarkey Vista or approved alternate) Install drip-edge flashing at all rake/gable edges. Install ridge vent at horizontal ridges. Install new lead boots at electrical mast. Install all new lead pipe boots. clean gutters and downspouts. Contractor responsible for all permitting. Contract completion date to be mutually determined at award of contract. **Work to be completed by November 30th 2023.** 

Upon completion, clean all work related debris from site.

Additional Documents: Project Manual			
Contact Name: Tom Fallon, Park Superintenden Phone: 360-221-7181	,——————————————————————————————————————		
Email: Parkmaint@whidbey.org			
	\ <u>-</u>	_	
Vendor shall complete the area below:			
within the time specified herein. In the ev performance by the vendor of any or all of products defined herein, shall constitute ac requirements of the resulting agreement.  Company Name:  Olympic Roofing, LLC	the services, or deliver	ry of any or	all of the
Address: 1505 S 356th St. Ste 112	License #: OLYN	IPRL834P	Q
City: Federal WaY	State: WA	Zip:	98003
Email: JEN@OLYMPICROOFINGLLC.COM	Phone: 253-878-5311	Fax:	
Print Name and Title: Jennifer Hudson, Office Ma	anager		``
No Bid [ ] Reason:			

## RFQ # TBD

### **Bid Price Form:**

Item	Description	Unit Price	Qty	Ext. Price
A	Roof replacement according to specifications.	\$48,900.00	1	\$48,900.00
В	Cost per linear foot for any new facia needed		TBD	
С	Cost per square foot for decking replacement	\$10.00	TBD	
D	Add Alt for replacement of gutters and downspouts in like fashion.	\$15,000.00	1	
E				
	Applicable state sales tax (8.8%)			
		Total	Price>	

Company Name: V&R Sheet Metal DBA V&R Roofing

Signature: Robert Gerlach

Print Name and Title: Robert Gerlach - Vice President / Chief Estimator

Date: 07/27/2023

5475 Maxwelton Road Langley, WA 98260 360-221-7187

## **Request for Quote - TBD**

This is not an order.

**RFO # TBD** - July 17th, 2023

**Description:** Shingle Re-roofing of the South Whidbey Baseball Facility(5495 Maxwelton Rd, Langley, WA 98260) site with an area of approximately 2,500 sq.ft. Project to include: Removal of existing roofing and proper disposal. Repair/replace any damaged decking, fascia or trim on a unit cost basis. Apply ice and water shield to entire roof(Garland R-mer Seal SA Underlayment or other pre-approved product). Install composition shingles meeting ASTM D 3161 Class F and ASTM D 7158 Class H wind standards, Class A fire resistance, ASTM D3018 D3462 (CertainTeed Landmark, Malarkey Vista or approved alternate) Install drip-edge flashing at all rake/gable edges. Install ridge vent at horizontal ridges. Install new lead boots at electrical mast. Install all new lead pipe boots. clean gutters and downspouts. Contractor responsible for all permitting. Contract completion date to be mutually determined at award of contract. **Work to be completed by November 30th 2023.** 

Upon completion, clean all work related debris from site.

Additional Documents: Project Manual	
Contact Name: Tom Fallon, Park Superintende	ent
<b>Phone:</b> 360-221-7181	<b>Fax:</b> 360-221-7323
Email: Parkmaint@whidbey.org	
	*
Vendor shall complete the area below:	
date received, to furnish all items or serv within the time specified herein. In the e	s offer is accepted within 30 calendar days from the ices quoted, at the prices set forth in this quotation, event of a contract award pursuant to this request, of the services, or delivery of any or all of the acceptance of all terms, conditions and
Company Name: V&R Sheet Metal DBA V&R	Roofing
Address: 2920 South Cushman Avenue	License #: VRSHESM973KM
City: Tacoma	State: Washington Zip: 98409
Email: RobG@VRRoofing.net	Phone: <b>253-576-5291</b> Fax: <b>253-328-6877</b>
Print Name and Title: Robert Gerlach - Vice Pr	esident / Chief Estimator
No Bid [ ] Reason:	

# RFQ # TBD

Item	Description	Unit Price	Qty	Ext. Price	
A	Roof replacement according to specifications.	\$59,732.00	1	\$59,732.00	
В	Cost per linear foot for any new facia needed	\$13.00	Linear Foot		
С	Cost per square foot for decking replacement	\$11.88	SQ. FT.		
D	Add Alt for replacement of gutters and downspouts in like fashion.	\$26.00	Linear foot		
E					
	Applicable state sales tax (8.8%)			\$5,256.42	
	Total Price>				

Company Name:	James King Roofing, LLC
Signature:	
Print Name and Title:	Charles Avery / Estimator
Date:	July 27th, 2023

5475 Maxwelton Road Langley, WA 98260 360-221-7187

## **Request for Quote - TBD**

This is not an order.

**RFQ # TBD** - July 17th, 2023

**Description:** Shingle Re-roofing of the South Whidbey Baseball Facility(5495 Maxwelton Rd, Langley, WA 98260) site with an area of approximately 2,500 sq.ft. Project to include: Removal of existing roofing and proper disposal. Repair/replace any damaged decking, fascia or trim on a unit cost basis. Apply ice and water shield to entire roof(Garland R-mer Seal SA Underlayment or other pre-approved product). Install composition shingles meeting ASTM D 3161 Class F and ASTM D 7158 Class H wind standards, Class A fire resistance, ASTM D3018 D3462 (CertainTeed Landmark, Malarkey Vista or approved alternate) Install drip-edge flashing at all rake/gable edges. Install ridge vent at horizontal ridges. Install new lead boots at electrical mast. Install all new lead pipe boots, clean gutters and downspouts. Contractor responsible for all permitting. Contract completion date to be mutually determined at award of contract. **Work to be completed by November 30th 2023.** 

Upon completion, clean all work related debris from site.

Opon completion, clean an work related debits from site.					
Additio	nal Documents: Project Manual				
Contact	t Name: Tom Fallon, Park Superintendent _		<del></del>		
	360-221-7181				
Email:	Parkmaint@whidbey.org				
:					
Vendor	shall complete the area below:				
) 1 1	The undersigned offers and agrees, if this offer date received, to furnish all items or services within the time specified herein. In the event performance by the vendor of any or all of the products defined herein, shall constitute accep- requirements of the resulting agreement.	quoted, at the prices set for of a contract award pursue e services, or delivery of a	orth in this quotation, nant to this request, any or all of the		
Company	Name: James King roofing, LLC				
Address: 12407 Mukilteo Speedway Suite #155 License #: JAMESKR823NW					
City: Mu	ıkilteo	State: WA.	Zip: 98087		
Email: <u>C</u>	harlesa@jameskingroofing.com Pho	one: 425-374-7955	_ Fax:		
Print Nan	ne and Title: Charles Avery / Estimator				
No Bid [	] Reason:				